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#1 best-selling guide to Cuba *

Lonely Planet Cuba is your passport to the most relevant, up-to-date advice on what to see and skip, and
what hidden discoveries await you. Take a drive along Havana's Malecon, soak up the live music scene,
make yourself at home in a casa particular all with your trusted travel companion. Get to the heart of Cuba
and begin your journey now!

Inside Lonely Planet Cuba:

Full-color maps and images throughout●

Highlights and itineraries help you tailor your trip to your personal needs and interests●

Insider tips to save time and money and get around like a local, avoiding crowds and trouble spots●

Essential info at your fingertips - hours of operation, phone numbers, websites, transit tips, prices●

Honest reviews for all budgets - eating, sleeping, sight-seeing, going out, shopping, hidden gems that●

most guidebooks miss
Cultural insights give you a richer, more rewarding travel experience - history, architecture, cuisine,●

music, dance, landscape, wildlife, literature, arts, politics
Free, convenient pull-out Havana map (included in print version), plus over 80 color maps●

Covers Havana, Artemisa, Mayabeque, Isla de la Juventud, Valle de Vinales, Pinar del Rio, Varadero,●

Matanzas, Cienfuegos, Villa Clara, Trinidad, Sancti Spiritus, Ciego de Avila, Camaguey, Las Tunas,
Holguin, Granma, Santiago de Cuba, Guantanamo and more

The Perfect Choice: Lonely Planet Cuba , our most comprehensive guide to Cuba, is perfect for both
exploring top sights and taking roads less traveled.

Looking for more extended coverage? Check out Lonely Planet's Discover Caribbean Islands guide.●

Authors: Written and researched by Lonely Planet, Brendan Sainsbury and Luke Waterson

About Lonely Planet: Since 1973, Lonely Planet has become the world's leading travel media company
with guidebooks to every destination, an award-winning website, mobile and digital travel products, and a
dedicated traveler community. Lonely Planet covers must-see spots but also enables curious travelers to get
off beaten paths to understand more of the culture of the places in which they find themselves.

Lonely Planet guides have won the TripAdvisor Travelers' Choice Awards in 2012, 2013, 2014 and 2015 in
the Favorite Travel Guide category.

*Best-selling guide to Cuba. Source: Nielsen BookScan. Australia, UK and USA. Mar 2014 - Feb 2015
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From reader reviews:

Debra Jones:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Lonely Planet Cuba (Travel Guide).

Jennifer Vickery:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel
happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Lonely Planet Cuba
(Travel Guide) is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Suk Barry:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This particular Lonely Planet Cuba (Travel Guide) can give you a
lot of buddies because by you taking a look at this one book you have point that they don't and make you
actually more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
reserve offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than some other
make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have Lonely Planet Cuba (Travel Guide).

Kenneth Matson:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book
Lonely Planet Cuba (Travel Guide). You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed
book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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